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As important a book today as it was when it was first written, The Red Badge of Courage tells the story of
Henry Fielding, a farm boy who sets out in search of glory by running away from home to join the Civil
War, only to find himself running away from the battlefield in terror during the first skirmish. Mortified by
his cowardice, Henry yearns for a wound, his own red badge of courage, which would legitimize his
desertion of his company. When Henry is finally wounded, he finds himself feeling real anger for the very
first time, and finally is able to redeem himself.

First published in 1865, and in print for 137 years, Stephen Crane's story is considered one of the most
important novels of the nineteenth century. It explores the dual natures of battle -- the simultaneous
sensations of beauty and violence, of terror and triumph -- and masterfully mirrors them to Henry's own
inner turmoil. Fervent and patriotic illustrations by Wendell Minor make The Red Badge of Courage an
important addition to the Scribner Illustrated Classics series.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Swafford:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you
can add your knowledge by the e-book entitled The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic
Series). Try to the actual book The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series) as your
buddy. It means that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside those of course make
you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we should make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Inez Tuller:

Here thing why this kind of The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series) are different and
reliable to be yours. First of all studying a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is
the content is as delightful as food or not. The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series)
giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no e-
book that similar with The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series). It gives you thrill
reading through journey, its open up your own eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is
probably can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your
way home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of The Red
Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series) in e-book can be your choice.

Brian Griffith:

Do you among people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series) book is
readable by means of you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for
enjoyable studying experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you.
The writer associated with The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series) content conveys
prospect easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it
just different available as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner
Illustrated Classic Series) is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Charles Baker:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24 hours a



day to reading a publication. The book The Red Badge of Courage (Scribner Illustrated Classic Series) it
doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people were
enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the
actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this
book provides high quality.
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