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In this one-of-a-kind volume, you'll learn everything under the sun about producer-director-star Robert
Clarke's 1959 monster classic: Clarke's in-depth account of the making of his low-budget independent
movie; reprints of TWO versions of the script, the first set in the jungles of Guatemala; the full story of SUN
DEMON's world premiere at a Texas drive-in; anecdotal memories of the frantic filmmaking process from
nearly a dozen cast-and-crew participants; the original "Showmanship Manual"; an outline for a follow-up
SUN DEMON film proposed by Clarke in the 1970s; scores of rare and never-seen photographs; even an
afterword from sexquisite co-star Nan Peterson! This is the first in a series of such books from longtime
genre fan and chronicler Tom Weaver.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Duckett:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Scripts from the Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon (Volume 1).
Try to face the book Scripts from the Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon (Volume 1) as your good friend. It
means that it can to be your friend when you sense alone and beside that of course make you smarter than
ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you much more confidence because you can
know every thing by the book. So , let us make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Ramona Johnson:

The book Scripts from the Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon (Volume 1) has a lot details on it. So when you
read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. The author
makes some research prior to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can get the point
easily after looking over this book.

Janna Lefevre:

Scripts from the Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon (Volume 1) can be one of your nice books that are good
idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary which could
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information.
The writer giving his/her effort to get every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Scripts from the
Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon (Volume 1) yet doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest
and also based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can drawn
you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.

Jerry Ingle:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book and also novel and Scripts from the Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon
(Volume 1) or perhaps others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly amazing
a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe
students especially. Those publications are helping them to add their knowledge. In various other case,
beside science publication, any other book likes Scripts from the Crypt: The Hideous Sun Demon (Volume
1) to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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