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Mary Anning was only twelve years old when, in 1811, she discovered the first dinosaur skeleton--of an
ichthyosaur--while fossil hunting on the cliffs of Lyme Regis, England. Until Mary's incredible discovery, it
was widely believed that animals did not become extinct. The child of a poor family, Mary became a fossil
hunter, inspiring the tongue-twister, "She Sells Sea Shells by the Seashore." She attracted the attention of
fossil collectors and eventually the scientific world. Once news of the fossils reached the halls of academia, it
became impossible to ignore the truth. Mary's peculiar finds helped lay the groundwork for Charles Darwin's
theory of evolution, laid out in his On the Origin of Species. Darwin drew on Mary's fossilized creatures as
irrefutable evidence that life in the past was nothing like life in the present.

A story worthy of Dickens, The Fossil Hunter chronicles the life of this young girl, with dirt under her
fingernails and not a shilling to buy dinner, who became a world-renowned paleontologist. Dickens himself
said of Mary: "The carpenter's daughter has won a name for herself, and deserved to win it."

Here at last, Shelley Emling returns Mary Anning, of whom Stephen J. Gould remarked, is "probably the
most important unsung (or inadequately sung) collecting force in the history of paleontology," to her
deserved place in history.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Rodriquez:

Here thing why this The Fossil Hunter: Dinosaurs, Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries Changed
the World (MacSci) are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all studying a book is good however it
depends in the content than it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. The Fossil Hunter: Dinosaurs,
Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries Changed the World (MacSci) giving you information deeper
and in different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no publication that similar with The
Fossil Hunter: Dinosaurs, Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries Changed the World (MacSci). It
gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which happened in the
world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in area, café,
or even in your way home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the
form of The Fossil Hunter: Dinosaurs, Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries Changed the World
(MacSci) in e-book can be your option.

Elliot Weber:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can easily share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story as
well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the data about
something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children, there
are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their talent in
writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this The Fossil
Hunter: Dinosaurs, Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries Changed the World (MacSci).

Jimmy Stone:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get lots of stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the book you have
read will be The Fossil Hunter: Dinosaurs, Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries Changed the
World (MacSci).

Verna Hibbard:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen require book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those books have
many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. By the book
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we can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? For being creative person must like
to read a book. Simply choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change
your life with that book The Fossil Hunter: Dinosaurs, Evolution, and the Woman Whose Discoveries
Changed the World (MacSci). You can more attractive than now.
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