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Did our ancestors live in tropical forests? Although we see the rainforest as a bountiful environment teeming
with life forms, most anthropologists and archaeologists have long viewed these areas as too harsh for human
occupation during the pre-agricultural stages of hominid development. Under the Canopy turns conventional
wisdom on its head by providing a well-documented, geographically diverse overview of Stone Age sites in
the wet tropics. New research indicates that, as humanity and its precursors increased their geographical and
ecological ranges, rainforests were settled at a much earlier period than had previously been thought.
Featuring the work of leading scholars from Australia, Brazil, Canada, Colombia, France, Malaysia, Panama,
Spain, and the United States, Under the Canopy creates a new niche in paleolithic studies: the archaeology of
tropical rainforests. This book provides the first synthesis of archaeological research in early foraging sites
across the rainforest zone, and indicates that tropical forests could harbor important clues to human
evolution, origins of modern behavior, cultural diversity, and human impact on tropical ecosystems.
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From reader reviews:

Christina Mundell:

The book Under the Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical Rainforests can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book Under the
Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical Rainforests? A number of you have a different opinion about book.
But one aim that will book can give many information for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
along with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are able
to share all of these. Book Under the Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical Rainforests has simple shape
however you know: it has great and large function for you. You can appear the enormous world by open and
read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Shawn Howe:

Why? Because this Under the Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical Rainforests is an unordinary book that
the inside of the book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will jolt you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such amazing way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good
for you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will
give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking way. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I were you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Phillip Martin:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the most effective book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever through
searching from it. It is called of book Under the Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical Rainforests. You can
contribute your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make a
person happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one
destination to other place.

Mark Klein:

Many people said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when they get a
half parts of the book. You can choose typically the book Under the Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical
Rainforests to make your current reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is
developing when you just like reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle
the opinion about book and looking at especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open a book
and study it. Beside that the e-book Under the Canopy: The Archaeology of Tropical Rainforests can to be
your friend when you're sense alone and confuse using what must you're doing of these time.
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