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Returning to Russia from a tour in Italy, twenty-three-year-old Dimitry Sanin breaks his journey in
Frankfurt. There he encounters the beautiful Gemma Roselli, who works in her parents' patisserie, and falls
deeply and deliriously in love for the first time. Convinced that nothing can come in the way of everlasting
happiness with his fiancée, Dimitry impetuously decides to begin a new life and sell his Russian estates. But
when he meets the potential buyer, the intriguing Madame Polozov, his youthful vulnerability makes him
prey for a darker, destructive infatuation. A novel of haunting beauty, Spring Torrents (1870-1) is a
fascinating, partly autobiographical account of one of Turgenev's favourite themes - a man's inability to love
without losing his innocence and becoming enslaved to obsessive passions.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Florence Whitney:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something
that they don't wish do that. You must know how great and also important the book Spring Torrents (Penguin
Classics). All type of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet options or other
social media.

Johnny Allen:

The feeling that you get from Spring Torrents (Penguin Classics) will be the more deep you searching the
information that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to recognise but Spring Torrents (Penguin Classics) giving you excitement feeling of reading.
The copy writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood through anyone who read it
because the author of this publication is well-known enough. That book also makes your own vocabulary
increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this particular Spring Torrents (Penguin Classics) instantly.

Michelle Han:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Spring Torrents (Penguin Classics)
e-book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by
anyone who read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and producing skill
only for eliminate your current hunger then you still doubt Spring Torrents (Penguin Classics) as good book
not just by the cover but also with the content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its
cover, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense
already told you so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

William Carroll:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that.
What you need to do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books.
Among the books in the top collection in your reading list is actually Spring Torrents (Penguin Classics).
This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing to be precious
person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many advantages.
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